
Approve Award of Bid No. 2017-N to low bidder ADAPCO

 Fund:

001-6200-562.30-62X

1. Nature and purpose of agenda item:

Attach any correspondence information, documents and forms for action i.e., contract agreements, quotes, 
memorandums, etc.

2. Fiscal impact on current budget.

Is this a budgeted item? N/A

Yes Account No.

No Please list the proposed budget amendment to fund this 
request

Budget Amendment Number:

FROM: TO: AMOUNT:

X

For Use of County Manger Only:

Discussion ItemConsent Item

COLUMBIA COUNTY BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
AGENDA ITEM REQUEST FORM

The Board of County Commissioners meets the 1st and 3rd Thursday of each month at 5:30 p.m. in the Columbia 
County School Board Administrative Complex Auditorium, 372 West Duval Street, Lake City, Florida 32055. All agenda 
items are due in the Board’s office one week prior to the meeting date.

Today's Date: Meeting Date:

Name: Department: 

June 21, 2017 July 20, 2017

Purchasing Ray Hill 

Division Manager's Signature:

# 48
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District No. 1 - Ronald Williams
District No. 2 - Rusty DePratter
District No. 3 - Bucky Nash
District No. 4 - Everett Phillips
District No. 5 -urn Murphy

BOARD OI CouNTY CoMMIssIoNERs • CoLuMBIA COUNTY

Memo

Date: June 21, 2017

To:,_Ij9d of Commissioners

Frol1ay Hill, Purchasing Director

RE: Bid Award 2017-N ULV Approved Adulticide

I have reviewed the bids received along with the Ed Lontz, Mosquito Control
Director. We recommend award of this bid to low bidder ADAPCO for the
PBO based Adulticide.

I have attached the bid tabulation for your review.

BOARD MEETS FIRST ThURSDAY AT 5:30 P.M.
AND THIRD THURSDAY AT 5:30 RM.

P 0. BOX 1529 V LAKE CIV,’ FLORIDA 32056-1529 V PHONE (386) 755-4100 p
. 
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District No. 1 - Ronald Williams

District No. 2 - Rusty DePratter

District No. 3 - Bucky Nash

District No. 4 - Everett Phillips

District No. 5-Tim Murphy

BOARD OF CouNTY COMMISSIONERS • COLUMBIA COUNTY

MEMORANDUM

DATE: June 12, 2017

TO: Ray Hill, Purchasing Director

FR: Ed Lontz, Mosquito Control Director 4/
RE: ULV Approved Adulticide Bid —2017-N

Please be advised that I have reviewed the bids for the ULV Approved Adulticide
purchase of the PBO based Adulticide in the 275 gal/tote at $14.38/gal. The water base
is much more costly. At this time, I would like to recommend that the bid be awarded to
ADAPCO Inc., which was the low bidder and meets all bid requirements.

If you have any questions in regards to this matter, please let me know.

/pd I

XC: 2017-N Bid File

BOARD MEETS FIRST THURSDAY AT 5:30 P.M.
AND THIRD THURSDAY AT 5:30 RM.

P 0. BOX 1529 V LAKE CITY, FLORIDA 32056-1529 V PHONE (386) 755-4100
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BID TABULATION

BID NO. 2017-N

ULV APPROVED ADULTICIDE

Date of Bid: 5/2/2017 11:00AM

Ready to Use Permethrin / P.B.O. based U[V Approved Adulticide
Minimum 3.5% Permethrin

And/Or Alternate water based Permethrin product and provide mixing station

COMPANY NAME BID AMOUNTS

ADAPCO, Inc. PBO Based 2x2.Sgal/cs $16.76/gal Water Based 4xlgal/cs $135.00/gal
55 gal drum $14.96/gal 30 gal/drum $125.00/gal

$‘275 gal/tote $14.38/gal 275 gal/tote $no bid

UNIVAR USA, Inc. PBO Based 2x2.5gaI/cs $15.44/gal Water Based 4xlgaI/cs $no bid
30 gal/drum $15.02/gal 30 gal/drum $96.00/gal
55 gal drum $15.02/gal 275 gal/tote $no bid
275 gal/tote $15.02/gal

ALLPRO VECTOR GROUP PBO Based 2x2.5gal/cs $15.75/gal Water Based 4xlgal/cs $no bid
30 gal/drum $15.75/gal 2x2.5 gal/cs $118.00/gal
55 gal drum $15.24/gal 30 gal/drum $118.00/gal
275 gal/tote $15.24/gal 55 gal/drum $118.00/gal

275 gal/tote $118.00/gal
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BID FORM

BID NO. 2017-N

COWMBIA COUNTY BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS, LAKE CITY, FLORIDA

Bids must be received in the Office of the Board of County Commissioners, Columbia County, 135 NE

Hernando Avenue, P.O. Box 1529, Lake City, FL, 32056-1529. No later than 11:00 A.M. on May 2,

2017 in a sealed envelope plainly marked: “Sealed Bid For: ULV Approved Adulticide

Columbia County reserves the right to reject any and /or all bids and to accept the bid in the

county’s best interest, bid F.O.B., Columbia County, Florida.

Ready to Use Permethrin / P.3.0. based ULV Approved Adulticide

Minimum 3.5% Permethcin

Chemical Name: Pursuit 44 (4.6%) Pursuit 4-4 (4.6%) Pursuit 4-4 (4.6%)

Container Sizes: 2x2.5 gi case 55 gallon drum 275 gallon tote

Price per Gallon: £16.76/ni $14.96/gI $14.38/al

And/Or Alternate water based Permethrin product and provide mixing station

Special bid price valid throughout length of contract. See below.

Chemical Name: Aquareslin Aquareslin Aquareslin

Container Sizes: 4x1 gallon case 30 gallon drum No Bid tote

Price per Gallon: *$135.O0/gl *$12500/gl

________________

Special bid prices achieved by:
Purchase two 2x2.5 gl cases of Aquareslin at $202.50/gl, get one case free. 15 gallons final price would be $135.O0/gl,
Purchase two 30 gI drums of Aquareslin at $187 50/gI, get one drum free. 90 gallons final price would be 5125.DD/gl.

Bidder certifies that the equipment or products meets or exceeds the County Specifications and that

the undersigned bidder declares that I have carefully examined the specifications, terms and

conditions of this bid and I am thoroughly familiar with its provisions and the quality and type of

coverage called for and bid herein. The undersigned bidder further declares that he/she has not

divulged, discussed or compared their bid with any other bidders and has not colluded with any

other bidders or parties to a bid whatsoever for any fraudulent purpose.

COMPANY NAME: ADAPCO, LLC

ADDRESS: 550 Aero Ln., Sanford, FL 32771

PHONE: (800) 367-0659

REPRESENTATIVE NAME & TITLE: Jason Trumbetta, Duty Authorized

REPRESENTATIVE SIGNATURE:

______

DATE: April 25th. 2017
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BID FORM

BID NO. 2017-N
COLUMBIA COUNTY BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS, LAKE CITY, FLORIDA

Bids must be received in the Office of the Board of County Commissioners, Columbia County, 135 NE
Hernando Avenue, P.O. Box 1529, Lake City, FL, 32056-1529. No later than 11:00A.M. on May 2,
2017 in a sealed envelope plainly marked: “Sealed Bid For: ULV Approved Adufticide
Columbia County reserves the right to reject any and lot all bids and to accept the bid in the
county’s best interest, bid F.O.B., Columbia County, Florida.

Ready to Use Permethrin / P.B.O. based ULV Approved Adulticide
Minimum 3.5% Permethrin

Chemical Name: uTL4 4

_________

KOtfflOL 4Lj
Container Sizes: X .

.

case 30 o53 drum 75 tote
Price per Gallon: 15.44

_________

D (5 OL)

5O2 % co7e ‘c oz’Ot
- Picrt LIE2-Z

Bidder certifies that the equipment or products meets or exceeds the County Specifications and that
the undersigned bidder declares that I have carefully examined the specifications, terms and
conditions of this bid and am thoroughly familiar with its provisions and the quality and type of
coverage called for and bid herein. The undersigned bidder further declares that he/she has not
divulged, discussed or compared their bid with any other bidders and has not colluded with any
other bidders or parties to a bid whatsoever for any fraudulent purpose.

COMPANYNAME: SA ]
ADDRESS: I CQRRO < D, sf 2O SNF-3i9

- /- .—, — .— —

PHONE: 0 D (2i

REPRESENTATIVE NAME &TITLE: S U 1JT

REPRESENTATIVE SIGNATURE: 7LLL Li2

7

Chemical Name:

Container Sizes:

Price per Gallon:

And/Or Alternate water based Permethrin prodyct and provide mixing station
AQUA

_________

‘0iCL 3O1,,’

_________case ______drum

i:; 9(O
I-cci * 3YRiC 7

tote

DATE:
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BID FORM

BID NO. 2017-N

COLUMBIA COUNTY BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS, LAKE CITY, FLORIDA

Bids must be received in the Office of the Board of County Commissioners, Columbia County, 135 NE

Hernando Avenue, P.O. Box 1529, Lake City, FL, 32035-1529. No later than 11:00 A.M. on May 2,

2017 in a sealed envelope plainly marked: “Sealed Bid For: ULV Approved Adulticide

Columbia County reserves the right to reject any and br all bids and to accept the bid in the

county’s best interest, bid F.O.B., Columbia County, Florida.

Ready to Use Permethrin / P.B.O. based ULV Approved Adulticide

Minimum 3.5% Permethrin

Chemical Name: Fô V dJ
Container Sizes: , X,2-,5J case 3i55 drum c.55fi1=/ tote

Price per Gallon: 7 7!S 1S Zj) h/7?. t5Z/ ‘/ /. oô/7j

7S

And/Or Alternate water based Permethrin product and provide mixing station

Chemical Name:

___________ ___________ ___________

Container Sizes: , X2.5’case 3)Y5Sddrum 2.75-cZ/ tote

Price per Gallon: tl 6/.5ôiS c O/Q./ 3, 3/ó.6/j ‘// O

/to/J 4o.a/ $1’sos7

Bidder certifies that the equipment or products meets or exceeds the County Specifications and that

the undersigned bidder declares that I have carefully examined the specifications, terms and

conditions of this bid and lam thoroughly familiar with its provisions and the quality and type of

coverage called for and bid herein. The undersigned bidder further declares that he/she has not

divulged, discussed or compared their bid with any other bidders and has not colluded with any

other bidders or parties to a bid whatsoever for any fraudulent purpose.

COMPANY NAME: II /O Uc7 ‘ ,

ADDRESS: SJ/ J 3 /

PHONE: H’R i7-?V’o

REPRESENTATIVE NAME &TITLE: /SF //
J

REPRESENTATIVE SIGNATURE:

________________ __________________________________

DATE:
—

— / 9 7
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