From: Laurie Hodson

To: Laurie Hodson
Subject: FW: FW: Invoice: Columbia County FL. Culvert Application #47676
Date: Friday, October 30, 2020 4:20:17 PM

Thanks Laurie,

Can you please reactivate the permit for this home as well.
Thank you,

Bradley Franks

On Thu, Oct 29, 2020 at 4:44 PM Laurie Hodson <laurie_hodson@columbiacountyfla.com>
wrote:
LOT 8 SUNSET MEADOWS JOB

From: Web Master

Sent: Thursday, October 29, 2020 4:42 PM

To: Laurie Hodson <laurie_hodson@columbiacountyfla.com>
Subject: Invoice: Columbia County FL. Culvert Application #47676

Columbia County Fla.
Building and Zoning Application Permit Invoice

This is a template email. Please review and send this email to:

BRADLEY@BRADLEYFRANKS.COM

Dear BRADLEY FRANKS,
Your online application for a *"Culvert' permit has been approved and invoiced.

Your invoice, along with payment instructions have been attached.
Once payment has been received, you will receive a receipt and permit.

NOTE: Fee balances are not immediately updated using online Credit Card payments.
If you have paid permit fees using the online application site or by using the office dropbox,
please allow time for your payment to be processed.

You may login and download or upload documents or make a payment for this application
using the link below:

https://www.columbiacountyfla.com/PermitSearch/MyBNZPortallL ogin.aspx
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Building & Zoning Department

135 NE Hernando Ave.

Lake City, FL 32055

Phone:(386) 758-1008 or (386) 758-1124

Email: laurie_hodson@columbiacountyfla.com

Bradley Franks
Owner
386-755-2455
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